
The peace of God is weather proof and poverty proof.
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" To the law and to the testimony; if they speak not according to this word

it is because there is no light in them."—Isaiah 8:20
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The Need Of Decision For The Truth
By C. H. Spurgeon

Some things are true and
some things are false. I regard
that as an axiom; but there are
many persons who evidently do
not believe it. The current prin-
ciple of the present age seems
to be, "Some things are either
true of false, according to the
point of view from which you
look at them. Black is white,
and white is black according to
circumstances; and it does not
particularly matter which you
call it. Truth of course is true,
but it would be rude to say the
opposite is a lie; we must not
be bigoted, but remember the
motto, 'So many men, sal many
minds'." Our forefathers were
particular about maintaining
landmarks; they had strong no-
tions about fixed points of re-
vealed doctrine, and were very

tenacious of what they believed
to be scriptural; their fields
were protected by hedges and
ditches, but their sons have
grubbed up the hedges, filled up
the ditches, laid all level, and
played at leap-frog with the
boundary stones. The school of
modern thought laughs at the
ridiculous positiveness of Re-
formers and Puritans; it is ad-
vancing in glorious liberality,
and before long will publish a
grand alliance between heaven
and hell, or, rather, an amalga-
mation, of the two establish-
ments upon terms of mutual
concession, allowing falsehood
and truth to lie side by side, like
the lion with the lamb. Still,
for all that, my firm old-fash-
ioned belief is that some doc-
trines are true, and that state-
ments which are diameterically
opposite to them are not true—
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Why Baptists Should Abstain From 'Holy Week'
Eld. Roy Mason
Tampa, Florida

Every spring the ministerial
association in Tampa, Fla., puts

on a Good Friday affair, and
usually there are Baptist pastors

among the speakers. We be-
lieve that if Baptists would
think the thing through they
would not participate in any of
the "Holy Week" events. Why?
Because the entire "Holy Week"
calendar is a falsehood. Jesus

did not make His triumphal en-
try into Jerusalem on "Palm
Sunday." Careful study will
make this plain to any one.
Jesus was NOT crucified on
Good Friday — could not have
been and remained three days
and three nights in the tomb
(as is stated 11 times in the New
Testament). Some will suggest
that "part of a day or night"
was counted for the whole. Not
so. God does not fulfil His Word
in a half-hearted fashion, but
to the letter. Good Friday makes
Jesus out to be falsifier, and
denies the acciaacy cf the Scrip-
tures.

As to Easter, it is a lie cut out
of whole cloth. Easter has noth-
ing at all to do with the resur-

rection of Christ — not one

single thing! Easter is determ-

ined by the full moon and the

spring equinox and not by the
resurrection of Christ. The very
name is heathen, being the name
of the old Teutonic goddess of
spring. Rabbits and eggs are
pagan sex symbols, and have
naught to do with the resur-
rection. The Bible never men-
tions Easter save in one place
(Acts 12) and in that instance
it is a mistranslation, for the
Greek term used is "passover."
The first day of the week, call-
ed Sunday, is the Bible resur-
rection day, for it was on that
day that Jesus revealed Himself
as risen from the dead, and
after His resurrection He met
with His disciples on that day
— they continued to meet on
that day after His ascension,
and for nearly twenty centuries
Christians have met for worship
on that day. (Else why do we
meet on that day at all?)

Why should Baptists help per-
petuate a string of lies — Good
Friday — Easter — etc.?

Holy Week Picture Show

This year the ministerial as-
sociation went further than to
put on the usual Good Friday

service. They brought a picture

show — "The King Of Kings"

to one of the theatres, and school

children were sent in droves

to view it. It is doubtful if any-
thing is of greater moral and
spiritual harm to young people
than the movies. Theatre going
is one of the worst things prac-
ticed by church people in this
day. Certainly it is wrong to
start children going to a theape.
The writer of these lines did

, not permit his little daughter to
\ attend the show brought to town
by the ministers.

What About The "King
Of Kings?"

Years ago a picture show own-
er came to us and offered us a
free ticket to the "King of
Kings" which he was putting
on. It happened that just a week
before we had seen some in-
formation concerning this par-
ticular film, so with this fresh
in mind I said, "Mr. B— we saw
the staterhent last week that
three religious leaders were
called into consultation in film-
ing the 'King of Kings.' One was
a Roman' Catholic Jesuit (and
the Jeusits were at one time or
another driven out of different
countries in Europe in the past
for their skullduggery); the sec-
ond was a modernist preacher
(and they don't believe in the
deity of Christ); the third was
an orthodox Jewish rabbi, and
(Continued on Page Four)

The First Baptist Pulpit

"GOD'S FELLOW WORKERS"
"For we are labourers together

with God."—I Corinthians 3:9.

This text is taken from a very
unusual and a very interesting
setting. If you will read the
first part of the third chapter of
I Corinthians, you will find that
the church at Corinth was very
definitely divided on the sub-
ject of preachers. There were
two factions in this church at
Corinth. One of them was the
folk who thought Paul was the
biggest preacher in all the

world, and the other faction
were those who thought the
greatest of all preachers was
Apollos. As a result of these
two factions within the church,
the division became so great
that when Paul wrote to the
rhurch he referred to them as
"carnal" because of the factions
that had arisen within that
church.
In order that Paul might be

able to show them the fallacy of
their position he declared that
he himself was just a planter

 -

that when "No" is the fact, 'Yes'
must be abandoned. I believe
that the gentleman who has for
so long a time perplexed our
courts is either Sir Roger Tich-
borne or somebody else; I am
not yet able to conceive of his
being the true heir and an im-
postor at the same time. Yet
in religious matters the fash-
ionable standpoint is somewhere
in that latitude. We have a
fixed faith to preach, my breth-
ren, and we are sent forth with
a definite message from God.
We are not left to fabricate the
message as we go along. We
are not sent forth by our Master
with a general commission ar-
ranged on this fashion: "As you
shall think in your heart and in-
vent in your head, so preach.
Keep abreast of the time. What-
ever the people want to hear,

(Continued on page two)

and that Apollos was merely a
waterer. In other words, he took
the position that he and Apollos
were both just gardeners-one to
plant and the other to water, so
that actually neither of them
were anything. God was every-
thing. Paul was a planter, Apol-
los a waterer; but God was to
give the increase. Therefore, he
said to this church, "What's the
use of your fighting over which
one of the two nothings is the
greater."

(Continued on page two)

Ripley Tells This:
What Will Roman
Catholics Say!

A tower of the Cathedral at
Rouen, France, was built from
funds paid by parishioners for
permission to eat butter during
Lent.

STARTLING FIGURES!
Since the close of the war

there has been a great deal of,
talk in some circles regarding
a changed attitude on the part
of Soviet Russia toward re-
ligious beliefs. According to
Ripley's "Believe It Or Not,"
Josef Stalin and the Commu-
nists have since 1918, liquidated
by murder or exile 235,078
members of the clergy and de-
stroyed 88,074 edifices used for
worship. Included in the above
number are:

152,471 priests and monks, and
52,032 nuns of the Russian
church;

26,000 Rabbis and teachers of
the Jewish faith;

16,914 Armenian Mullahs;
5,106 priests of the Roman

Catholic Church;
2,025 Armenian priests;
520 Lutheran pastors.
The Communists have confis-

cated 18,500,000 acres of church
property and have stolen four
billion dollars' worth of church
funds.

—King's Busir



A God-forsaken man is a man that has forsaken God
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DECISION FOR THE TRUTH

(Continued from page one)
tell them that, and they shall be

saved." Verily, we read not so.

There is something definite in

the Bible. It is not quite a lump

of wax to be shaped at our will,

or a roll of cloth to be cut ac-

cording to the prevailing fash-

ion. Your great thinkers evi-

dently look upon the Scriptures

as a box of letters for them to

play with, and make what they

like of, or a wizard's bottle, out

of which they may pour any-

thing they choose, from atheism

up to spiritualism. I am too
old-fashioned to fall down and
worship this theory. There is
something told me in the Bible
—told me for certain—not put
before me with a "but" and a
"perhaps," and an "if," and a
"may be," and fifty thousand
suspicions behind it, so that

really the long and the short of

it is, that it may not be so at

all; but revealed to me as in-

fallible fact, which must be be-
lieved, the opposite of which is
deadly error, and comes from

the father of lies.
Believing, therefore, that

there is such a thing as truth,

and such a thing as falsehood,
that there are truths in the Bi-

ble, and that the gospel consists

in something definite which is
to be believed by men, it be-
comes us to be decided as to
what we teach, and to teach it

in a decided manner. We have

to deal with men who will be
either lost or saved, and they
certainly will not be saved by
erroneous doctrine. We have
to deal with God, whose serv-
ants we are, and he will not be
honored by our delivering false-
hoods; neither will he give us a
reward, and say, "Well done,

good and faithful servant, thou
hast mangled the gospel as ju-
diciously as any man that ever

lived before thee." We stand in
a very solemn position, and ours
should be the spirit of old
Micaiah, who said, "As the Lord
my God liveth, before whom I
stand, whatsoever the Lord
saith unto me, will I speak."
Neither less nor more than

God's word are we called to
state, but that word we are
bound to declare in a spirit
which convinces the sons of
men that, whatever they may
think of it, we believe God, and
are not to be shaken in our con-
fidence in him.
BRETHREN, IN WHAT

OUGHT WE TO BE POSITIVE?
Well, there are gentlemen alive
who imagine that there are no
fixed principles to go upon.
"Perhaps a few doctrines," said
one to me, "perhaps a few doc-
trines may be considered as es-
tablished. It is, perhaps, ascer-
tained that there is a God; but
one ought not to dogmatize upon

his personality: a great deal
may be said for pantheism."
Such men creep into the min-
istry, but they are generally
cunning enough to conceal the
breadth of their minds beneath
(Continued on Page Three)

•••••

THE BAPTIST EXAMINER

MAY 29. 1948

PAGE TWO

Everybody Is Asking. .
Since you are a stickler for

absolute Bible accuracy (which
everyone should be) I would es-
pecially like an answer to the
insistence of Seven-Day Adven-
tists that there is no good rea-
son whatsoever for calling Sun-
day the Lord's Day; that there
is absolutely no Biblical founda-
tion whatsoever for changing
worship from Saturday to Sun-
day. I am assuming, of course,
that you are agreed that Sunday
is the day. Frankly, I have ?tot
yet found what I consider as
sound an argument as I would
like to hear, to support Sunday.
One of the arguments is that the
disciples began meeting together
on Sunday, after the Resurrec-
tion, and for which I have not
seen much Bible support. An-
other one is that Jesus rose from
the dead on Sunday, and that
every Sunday is, in a way, a
commemoration of His resurrec-
tion. Incidentally, you insisted
in a recent issue of your paper
that Jesus arose around six o'-
clock Saturday afternoon, not on
Sunday. While I am reasonably
sure that I recall reading that
the disciples met once, or pos-
sibly twice on Sunday, shortly
after His resurrection, this date
does not seem to me sufficient
evidence that the Sabbath was
changed to Sunday by them.
though I ant not prepared to
argue that point. I will certainly
appreciate your comment on this
when you have time.

Before proceeding, turn and
read Genesis 2:1-3.
Here we are told that all was

done so far as Creation was con-
cerned, there was nothing more
to be done, and therefore the
One who had during six days,
been working, ceased to work
and enjoyed His rest; all was
complete; all was just as He
Himself had made it; and He
rested in it; the work of Crea-
tion was ended, and God was
celebrating in a Sabbath; this is
the true character of a sabbath.
This is the only sabbath which
God ever celebrated, "so far as
the Bible tells us. After this we
read of God's commanding man
to keep the sabbath, and man
utterly failing to do so; but you
never read again in the Bible,
"God rested"; on the contrary
the word is, "My Father work-
eth hitherto, and I work." John
5:17.
The Sabbath in the proper

sense of the term, could only
be celebrated when there really
was nothing to be done; it could
only be celebrated amid an un-
defiled creation, a creation on
which no spot of sin could be
discerned.

Could God have rest where
there is sin? I am sure He could
not.
The fruits of this groaning cre-

ation rise before us and declare
that God is at work and not at
rest. He cannot rest amid the
sighs and tears, the groans and
sorrows, the sickness and death,
of a ruined world.

God has no sabbath save the
one recorded in Geensis second
chapter, the seventh day. It
showed forth the completeness
of creation; but creation work is
marred and the Seventh Day
rest has been interrupted. So

from the Fall to the Incarnation,
God was working; from the In-
carnation to the Cross, God the
Son was working; and from
Pentecost (when the church was
filled with the Holy Spirit) God
the Holy Spirit has been and is
working.

Christ had no sabbath when
He was upon earth; sure He
finished His work, but where
did He spend the Sabbath Day?
In the Tomb! The Creator, God
manifested in the flesh, the Lord
of the Sabbath spent the sev-
enth day, the Sabbath, in the
Tomb.
Could the Son of God lie in

the grate on the Seventh Day, if
that day were to be spent in rest
and peace, and in the full sense
that there remained nothing to
be done?

Man's long career of guilt has
climaxed in crucifying the Lord
of glory, not only crucifying
Him, but placing a great stone
at the mouth of the tomb to
keep Him from leaving it. What
is man doing while the Son of
God is in the tomb? He is try-
ing to KEEP the Sabbath as

I though it were not broken at
all; this was "man's sabbath,"
not God's; it was a sabbath
without Christ, empty, power-
less, worthless, because Christ-
less, Godless.
You say "the day has been

changed while all the principles
belonging to it remain the
same?"

There is absolutely no Scrip-
tural warrant for such an idea
—if so, I am waiting for the
"Scriptural proof." I know in
speaking of His idolatrous peo-
ple Israel, God said, "I will also
cause all her mirth to cease, her
feast days, her new moons, and
her sabbaths, and all her solemn
feasts," Hos. 2:11, but that does
not say "I WILL DESTROY MY
SABBATH." Israel was wor-
shipping Baal, and certainly
they had solemn feasts and sab-
baths, and God destroyed all
these, but He did not destroy
nor change His Sabbath; He de-
stroyed 'her sabbath.'
The distinction between the

First Day of the Week and the
Sabbath or Seventh Day of the
Week, is most fully maintained
in the New Testament. Get this
one passage, "In the end of the
Sabbath, as it began to dawn to-
wards the first day of the week,
etc,' Matt. 28: 1. There is no
mention here of the Seventh
Day betng changed to the First
Day, or the Sabbath being
changed to Sunday. There is no
Scripture that says that either
man or God has ever changed
God's Law at any time; man has
tried but it has not been done;
certainly there has been no
transfer of the Sabbath to the
First Day of the Week.
God gave ten commandments,

and the breaking of one of them
meant death to the offender; the
first was, "Thou shalt have no
other gods before Me"; the
fourth is "Remember the Sab-
bath day to keep it holy." If
the latter has been changed why
not the first! God has never
changed one of His command-

ments. All are just as holy and
binding as ever; to say, "the
Sabbath day has been changed
to the first day of the week,
and now Sunday is the Chris-
tian's sabbath" is to reveal one's
ignorance of God's inexorable
Law.
Nowhere in the New Testa-

ment do we read that the Sab-
bath Day has been changed to
the First Day of the week; that
the Sabbath Day (Saturday)
has been changed to Sunday!
The First Day of the week is

not the Sabbath, but it is alto-
gether a New Day; it is the First
Day of a new period, not the
Last day of an Old peroid.
The Seventh day stands con-

nected with earth and earthly
rest, the First day of the week
introduces us to heaven and
heavenly rest.

If I try to celebrate the Sev-
enth Day, like Adventists and
some others do, it marks me as
an earthy-man because that day
is clearly the rest of earth, or
creation-rest; but if I am taught
by the Word and the Spirit to
understand the meaning of the
First Day of the week, I shall
understand the heavenly order
of things, of which the death
and resurrection of my Lord
form the everlasting foundation.
The Seventh Day belongs to

Israel and to earth — the First
Day belongs to the Church of
Christ Jesus and to Heaven.
Israel was commanded to ob-
serve the Sabbath Day; the
Churches of Christ are privi-
leged to enjoy the First Day of
the week. The observance of
the Sabbath Day was to test Is-
rael's moral condition; the ob-
servance of the Lord's Day (First
Day of the week) is significant
proof of the Church's eternal ac-
ceptance.
The querist said something

about our Lord rising from the
tomb around six o'clock Satur-
day afternoon, not on Sunday;
that is exactly correct, and that
forever kills all your Easter pro-
grams, for there is nothing in
the New Testament that war-
rants such a program; the Lord
did not rise from the tomb on
any Sunday morning; there is no
Easter Sunday; it is to follow
the ancient heathen to say there
is and to celebrate Easter; I for
one do not, I never have, and by
His grace I never shall.
One other thought, we read,

"In the END of the SABBATH,
as it began to dawn toward the
FIRST DAY OF THE WEEK,
came Mary Magdalene and the
other Mary to see the sepulchre
... And the angel answered and
said unto the women, Fear not
ye: for I know that ye seek

Jesus, which was crucified. C.
is not here: for He is risen
He said. Come see the p
where the Lord lay."—Matt. alr1s
1-6.
This does not even hint trlhe

Jesus rose from that tomb
Sunday morning as all E A Pe
observers say and believe. 114's
women went to the tomb at
end of the Sabbath, as it bel 4̀0(
to dawn toward the first daY,
the week. Jesus was not thee.

d eHe had risen from the tomb
fore they came. He could
have risen from the grave
Sunday morning. Read a
Matthew 28:1; when the wo
reached the tomb very early,
it began to dawn toward
first day of the week, they fo
that tomb empty. He arose
Saturday evening, not on S'
day morning. Again I say
others of my brethren, the'
no Easter Sunday.
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our text, but listen: ther
"We then as WORKERS aria

GETHER WITH HIM, best be
you also that ye receive note rr
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EUROPE NEEDS THE GOSPEL the

!tn,Too often we think only of China, India, Africa anu'ver,
the islands of the sea as needing missionaries to bring Lilo
them the gospel of Christ which is "the power of God rt sl
unto salvation to everyone that believeth" (Rom. 1: 16); rkeil
but consider Europe's deep need as revealed in the ,
following table:

It
Czechoslovakia has 14.000.000 people but only 70/
Rumania _ _. has 13,000,000 people but only 74 

h
trrii

Poland
are

rrrre eee P

has 25,000,000 people but only 4% 

a

Yugoslavia has 15,700.000 people but only 2% 

a 

Russia   has 183,000,000 people but only 20/ 
a 

Greece 

arc Protestant

  has 7.000,000 people but only 2% are Protestant

Protest
s"PPPrrrr oeeet ee ssaaee eretnt aaaa it;France  has   42, 0 00, 000 people      but   only   2 % a

PItoarlytugal   
has 45.800,000 people but only 2% are Protestant
has 7.200,000 people but only 2% are Protestant

Spain has 28,000,000 people but only I% are Protestant
Bulgaria  has 6.100,000 people but only I% 

re P 

t
Belgium  has 8,300,000 people but only 1% are Prroatteesattaanat

Southern Holland is 97% Roman Catholic.
Albania has only 50 Protestants out of 1,003,000

peofletis.
forbidden to read the Bible in Spain.

Russia allows no foreign missionary within its bor-
ders.

Millions in Europe have never once in their lives
seen a copy of the Bible!

Q)4111...



God writes with a pen that never blots, speaks with a tongue that never slips, and acts with a hand that never fails
. CISION FOR THE TRUTH
0
p (Continued from page two)
,. ristian phraseology, thus act-

g in consistency with their
inciples, for their fundamental

b ' e is that truth is of no con-
.tience.

, As for us—as for me, at any
1 te--1 am certain that there is
)e God, and I mean to preach it
al a Man does who is absolutely
.11, e. He is the Maker of heaven
b '' earth, the Master of provi-
I hee, and the Lord of grace;
re ' his name be blessed forever1
a ever! We will have no
0, estions and debates as to Him.
y, We are equally certain that
4 . book which is called "the
to 'i)le" is His word, and is in-
se Ired: not inspired in the sense
si Which Shakespeare, and Mil-

and Dryden may be in
et 

-
ired, but in an infinitely,
goer sense; so that, provided
e have the exact text, we re-
rd the words themselves as
fallible. We believe that

:E Ything stated in the book
at Comes to us from God is to

)tie ,accepted by us as His sure
le 'thriony, and nothing less than
a 'at. God forbid we should be
/et hared by those various in-
Lb' 'Pretations of the modus of in-
en !ration which amount to
Ole more than frittering it
' ay. The book is a divine

but,Muction; it is perfect, and is
lg 1,e last court of appeal—"the
rtiOttge which ends the strife." I
1 1 as soon dream of bias-

itlli eni, ing my Maker as of ques-
11418 the infallibility of His

r".
NI We are also sure concerning
au doctrine of the Blessed Trin-
al t'h We cannot explain how the
irc)kier, Son, and Spirit can be

one distinct and perfect in
Self, and yet that these three
one, so that there is but one
, Yet we do verily believe it,
'bean to preach it, itotwith-
,r1,ing Unitarian, Socinian,
"eilian, or any other error.
Shall hold fast evermore the
trine of the Trinity of Unity.

1 Ild, brethren, there will bc
Uncertain sound from us a
the atonement of our Lord

411,s Christ. We cannot leave
°lend out of our ministry, or

1)0
. 

life of it will be gone; fol
nw,,,,i tnaY say of the gospel, "The
oro-°r1 is the life thereof." The
„ Pier substitution of Christ, the
FO tarious sacrifice of Christ, on
bes behalf of his people, that

rbight live through Him—
' 4 ‘'ve must publish till we die.

hseither can we waver in our
thld for a moment concerning
he lipdgreat and glorious Spirit of
orl , the fact of His existence,
:hiS'-- Personality, the power of
hree , working, the necessity of
'hfluences, the certainty that
than is regenerated except by
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to tell them that they are born
sinners, and must be born saints
or they will never see the face
of God with acceptance.
The tremendous evil of sin—

we shall not hesitate about that.
We shall speak on that matter
both sorrowfully and positively;
and, though some very wise
men raise difficult questions
about Hell, we shall not fail to
declare the terrors of the Lord,
and the fact that the Lord has
said, "These shall go away into
everlasting punishment, but the
righteous into life eternal."

Neither will we ever give an
uncertain sound as to the glori-
ous truth that salvation is all oc
grace. If ever we ourselves are
saved, we know that sovereign
grace alone has done it, and we
feel it must be the same with
others. We will publish, "Grace!
grace! grace!" with all our

might, living and dying.
We shall be very decided,

also, as to justification by faith,
for salvation is "Not of works,
lest any man should boast."
"Life in a look at the Crucified
One" will be our message. Trust
in the Redeemer will be that
saving grace which we will pray
the Lord to implant in all our
hearers' hearts.
And everything else which we

believe to be true in the Scrip-
tures we shall preach with de-
cision. If there be questions
which may be regarded as moot,
or comparatively unimportant,
we shall speak with such a mea-
sure of decision about them as
may be comely. But points
which cannot be moot, which
are essential and fundamental
will be declared by us without
any stammering, without any
inquiring of the people, "What
would you wish us to say?" Yes,
and without the apology, "Those
are my views, but other peo-
ple's views may be correct." We
ought to preach the gospel, not
as our views at all, but as the
mind of God—the testimony of
Jehovah concerning His own
Son, and in reference to Salva-
tion for lost men. If we had
been entrusted with the making
of the gospel, we might have
altered it to suit the taste of
this modest century, but never
having been employed to origi-
nate the good news, but merely
to repeat it, we dare not stir
beyond the record. What wr
have been taught of God we
teach. If we do not do this, we
are not fit for our position. If
I have a servant in my house,
and I send a message by her to
the door, and she amends it on
(Continued on page four)
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GOD'S FELLOW WORKERS

(Continued from page two)
bourers together with God. Just
remember, beloved, that Jesus
Christ finished His work on the
cross, and you and I begin our
work at the cross. You and I
have no works that are worthy
of mention until we come to
Calvary and put our trust in
Jesus Christ. From that hour
on, we are labourers together
with Him. I repeat, beloved,
that as Christ finished His work
at the cross, you and I begin
our work at the cross.
A most solemn thought is this,

beloved, in the implications that
this brings to us. If all my work
before I came to Calvary went
for nothing, and if since I came
to the cross I am a worker to-
gether with Him, then I need to
be mighty careful about my life
in every phase of it as it touches
upon this world. If I this morn-
ing, from the hour that I came
to Calvary, have been a worker
with Him, then I need to sol-
emnly reflect upon my speech,
my body's health, my influence
and my actions if I this morn-
ing and from the hour that I
was saved, have been a labourer

together with Him. This is a
solemn reflection, beloved, in
that I ought to be mighty care-
ful where I go, what I say, what
I do and the things that I enter
in upon. I know of nothing
more solemn or that should
bring a child of God a greater
sense of solemnity than this
truth that we are "labourers to-
gether with Him."

II

IT BRINGS TO US A SERI-
OUS QUESTION. Can't God do
everything Himself? That's the
position of the Hardshells.
That's what they say. I have
even heard Hardshell preachers
say that whether a man has ever
heard the Word of God when
God gets ready to save him,
He'll knock him down and save
him. That's a lie — that's not
God's Word.
I remember hearing a Baptist

preacher over at Cynthiana, Ky.,
at the General Association of
Kentucky Baptists several years
ago say that God could blot out
all the Baptists of Kentucky,
and all the Baptists of the
Southern Baptist Convention
and get along just as well with-
out them as He could with them.
That's a lie. God can't do it, for
God has chosen to work through
human beings. You ask this
morning, "Can't God do every-
thing by Himself?" It isn't a
question of what God can do,
the question is what God has
chosen to do; and God has
chosen to work through human
beings.
In the book of Acts, we have

the story of a deacon by the
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name of Philip who was sent of
God to preach to an Ethopian
eunuch. The Word of God tells
us that that Ethiopian eunuch
was definitely dependent upon
the man God sent to him, for
as Philip ran up to the chariot
and asked him if he understood
what he read, the eunuch said,

"How can I, except some MAN
should guide me?" — Acts 8:31.

He needed a man to guide
him into the knowledge of
truth. God has chosen to work
through human instrumentali-
ties. I am ready to grant you
that God has elected a certain
number of the human family
unto salvation. No individual in
all the world believes more
strongly in the doctrine of elec-
tion than I — that God has
chosen to Himself an elect num-
ber of the human family, and
every one of those elect shall
be saved. At the same time, be-
loved, God has elected that those
whom He has chosen shall be
saved through human instru-
mentalities, as human instru-
mentalities preach the Word of
God to those who are lost. Lis-
ten:

"The impotent man answered
him, Sir, I have no MAN, when
the water is troubled, to put
me into the pool: but while I
am coming another steppeth
down before me." — John 5: 7.
Here was a man who had had

an infirmity for 38 years, and
the Word of God says that he
realized that the reason he had
never been healed was because
he had no man to help him. I'm
saying to you this morning, be-

loved, though God in His omni-
potence can do everything, in
His omnicience He has chosen
not to do everything, but rather,
to work together through and
with and by His elect who have
been saved by grace.

IF THIS TEXT PRESENTS TO
US A SOLEMN THOUGHT
AND A SERIOUS QUESTION,
HOW MUCH MORE, BELOVED,
DOES IT IMPLY A SIGNAL
HONOR. Can you imagine an
honor any greater than the hon-
or being a worker together with
God? Imagine Raphael, supposed
to be the world's greatest paint-
er of all time, imagine him
asking the lad who cleans his
brushes to work with him on
some great picture that he might
be producing. What an honor
for that boy! Yet, beloved, for
the God of the universe, and
the Creator to ask of us, the
creatures of His creation, that
we should be labourers together
with Him far transcends any
honor that might have come to
the lad who cleaned the paint
brushes of the great painter.
Or imagine that the world's
greatest machinist who knows
more about the machines that
are used at the local round-
house than any individual that
has ever lived in the world—
imagine him this morning ask-
ing you to assist him on what
he is about to do. What an hon-
or! I imagine most everyone —
Republicans, Democrats, Com-
munists and what-not would
admit today that Mr. Truman
is facing at this hour a very 'se-
rious situation. I'm satisfied to-
day, beloved, that so far as our
nation is concerned, Mr. Tru-
man stands in need of advice
the like of which no individual
who has ever been president of
the United States has needed.
Suppose, beloved, in this pres-
ent emergency when wisdom
and intelligence are so greatly
and drastically needed — sup-
pose the president this morning
would invite you to come to the
White House today to be his
advisor, to become a part of
his brain trust, to offer wis-
dom in these hours of national
emergency. What an honor it
would be this morning for any
individual to be thus invited to
assist the president in this hour.
Yet, beloved, if you were in-
vited today to assist the presi-
dent, that would be just one
creature assisting another crea-
ture; but when I come to this
text, I realize that I have a
greater honor than any honor
that might thus come to man,
for I am invited of the Creator
of all creatures to be a labourer
together with Him within this
world. Truly it is a signal honor
to be a fellow worker with God.

Iv

THIS TEXT LIKEWISE PRE-
SENTS TO US SOME VERY
SOLEMN REFLECTIONS. If I
am to be a worker together with
God, then I MUST DO WHAT
GOD SAYS. Surely that's the
teaching of all the Word of
God. Listen:
"Be ye DOERS OF THE

WORD, and not hearers only.'
—James 1:22.
The Greek word translated

here is a compound word which.
literally means, "Be ye word
doers." It isn't just enough to
be a "doer," you are command-
ed to be a "word doer." Much
of our so-called church work
is an activity of the flesh, and
much of what goes on in the
name of church work is nothing
more or less than the energy of
one's own fleshly nature Our
Lord says you and I are to be
"word doers."

Notice again:
"Trust in the Lord with all

thine heart; and lean not unto

thine own understanding. In all
thy ways acknowledge him, and
he shall direct thy paths." —
Proverbs 3:5, 6.
I say then this morning, be-

loved, if we are to be God's
fellow workers, we must ack-
nowledge Him, we must do what
God Himself says — workers
together with God.
Likewise, beloved, if we are

God's fellow workers, then we
must realize that we are work-
ing together under Him, and
therefore we SHOULD EN-
COURAGE ONE ANOTHER as
we work with Him. There's a
remarkable Scripture within
this book that I came across
just a few days ago. Listen:
"But charge Joshua, and EN-

COURAGE HIM, and strengthen
him: for he shall go over be-
fore this people, and he shall
cause them to inherit the land
which thou shalt see." — Deut.
3:28.
God says to those who are to

be fellow labourers with Joshua
to encourage him and strength-
en him.
I remember attending the fu-

neral of a Baptist preacher
twenty years ago — a man who
had been a faithful, loyal, de-
voted servant of the Lord. At
his funeral the Sunday School
superintendent, various deacons
and other officers of the church
took part; and each one told
about this pastor who had died,
what a marvelous man of God
he was, and what a wonderful
thing it was to have been a
laborer together with him with-
in that church. When the serv-
ices were over, the widow of
that Baptist preacher said, "If
they had ever said those things
to my husband by way of en-
couragement, what joy it would
have been to him."
You and I are workers to-

gether with Him, and if we are
to work together under Him, we
ought to seek to encourage and
strengthen each other as we
labor with Him.
I say, beloved, if we are to be

God's fellow workers, there are
some solemn reflections that
come to us. If we are to be
workers with Him, we MAY
MAKE SOME ENEMIES. In
fact, we can be sure in advance
that we shall make enemies if
we are faithful in our effort
to work together with Him. Has
He not already given to us these
words by way of prophecy when
He said:
"And ye shall be hated of all

men for my name's sake: but he
that endureth to the end shall
be saved. But when they perse-
cute you in this city, flee ye
into another: for verily I say
unto you, Ye shall not have
gone over the cities of Israel,
till the Son of Man be come.
The disciple is not above his
master, nor the servant above
his Lord. It is enough for the
disciple that he be as his mas-
ter, and the servant as his lord.
If they have called the master
of the house Beelzebub, how
much more shall they call them
of his household?" — Matthew
10:22-25.
Why, beloved, if they called

my Lord a devil, shall you and
I not expect to be called like-
wise? If my Lord were perse-
cuted, and if He were hated and
ultimately brought to cruci-
fixion, shall you and I of His
household not likewise expect
that we shall make enemies if
we are labourers together with
Him?

I think one of the greatest
poems that I ever read, that has
helped me possibly more than
any other is this:
(Continued on page four)
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It is hard for Christ to find a door big enough to get into a stingy man's heart.

GOD'S FELLOW WORKERS

(Continued from page 3)
"He has no enemies, you say!
My friend, the boast is poor.

He who has mingled in the fray
Of duty that the strong en-

dure,
Must have made foes. If he has

none
Small is the work that he has

done;
He has bit no traitor on the hip,

He has cast no cup from tempt-

ed lip;
He has never turned the wrong

to right,
He has been a coward ink the

fight."
I contend this morning, be-

loved, that if you and I are to

be fellow workers with Him,

we may as well know in ad:

vance that we will make ene-

mies.
Again, as I solemnly reflect

upon this text, it comes to me
that if I am to work with God

as a fellow labourer, THEN I'LL
HAVE TO WAIT ON GOD. I
can't run ahead of Him, for God

and I are working together.

We are fellow workers. I have
to wait on God. Too many times
we try to run ahead of the
Lord. Too often we get before
Him and we get in His way. If
we are going to be fellow work-
ers with Him, then, beloved, we
need to wait on God.
"WAIT ON THE LORD: be of

good courage, and he shall
strengthen thine heart: wait, I
say, on the Lord." — Psalms 27:
14.
There is another remarkable

text of like nature given to us
in the Word of God. Listen:
"And it shall be, when thou

shalt hear a sound of going in
the tops of the mulberry trees,
that thou shalt go out to bat-
tle: for God is gone forth be-
fore thee to smite the host of
the Philistines." — I Chron. 14:
15.
This was when David was

reigning as king in Jerusalem.
God said, "When you go out
against the Philistines, you wait
until you hear a sound of going
in the top of the mulberry
tree. Don't go before that.
Whenever you hear that sound
in the top of the mulberry trees,
you can go forth then knowing
that God is going with you." I
say this morning if you and I
are going to be fellow workers
with God, then we have to wait
on God. We can't run before
Him.
Drive down the road and you

will come to a green light, or
rather, to a stop light. It is the
part of wisdom and prudence
to stop at that light and not
even run ahead when it flashes
caution, but rather, to wait un-
til that light gives to you a
green signal.
I contend this morning the

only position for a child of God
to take if he is going to be a
worker together with God, is
wait until God gives him a
green light, and when God gives
the go-signal, it is well then to
proceed. It is as dangerous for
a child of God to proceed with-
out the go-signal, as it is for
the driver of an automobile to
cross an intersection when the
caution light is flashing against
him. We need to wait on God.
OUR TEXT FURTHER GIVES
TO US SOME ENCOURAGE-
MENT. It says we are workers
together with Him. That means,
beloved, we are not working by
ourselves, we have God work-
ing with us. I am glad that in
the early days of my ministry
God impressed upon me the
truth of this text. It has helped
me over many a dark time and
has encouraged me when the
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going has been rough. It has
been one of the greatest bless-
ings I have ever known as I
have tried to serve Him just to
know that we are workers with
Him; therefore, He is with us;
He is going along; He is work-
ing with us all the time.

Listen to that glorious Great
Commission:
"Go ye therefore, and teach

all nations, baptizing them in
the name of the Father, and of
the Son, and of the Holy Spirit:
Teaching them to observe all
things whatsoever I have com-
manded you: and, lo, I AM
WITH YOU ALWAY, even unto
the end of the world." — Mat-
thew 28:19, 20.
What greater encouragement

could we ask for than to know
that as we go in labor for Him,
He goes beside us. Listen again:
"And they went forth, and

preached everywhere, THE
LORD WORKING WITH THEM
and confirming the word with
signs following." — Mark 16:20.
They didn't go out working by

themselves, ,but rather, they
went out the Lord working with
them.

remember •a number of
years ago when I was just a
boy preacher, just about the
time I was ordained, that I was
driving along a country road
and I saw a man from the high-
way who was sawing wood with
a cross-cut saw. I could only
see one man as he would pull
the saw backward and forward
across the log. The other end
of the saw was hidden from my
view around the corner of a
house, but I knew there was
someone there pulling at the
other end of the saw because of
the ease with which the man
worked that I could see.
Many and many is the time

that I have come back to that
thought since then. I can't see
Him, beloved, for these finite
eyes have never yet looked up-
on the infinite; but I know He
is there in view of the ease
with which God's child faces his
difficulties, and his problems
day by day. He is pulling along
side of the child of God. What
an encouragement it is this
morning to know that we are
workers together with God.
I wonder, beloved, if the

truth of this thought has grip-
ed your soul this morning. I
wonder if you realize today
that it is our task and our busi-
ness as His child to work to-
gether with Him. May the Lord
help you and me this morning
to leave this house of God to-
day with a new vision of Him,
and with a new realization that
we are going out not to be
drones, but are are going out
to be workers together with
Him.
May God bless you!

DECISION FOR THE TRUTH

(Continued from page 3)
her own authority, she may takc
away the very soul of the mes-
sage by so doing, and she will
be responsible for what she has
done. She will not remain long
in my employ, for I need a ser-
vant who will repeat what I say,
as nearly as possible, word for
word; and if she does so, I am
responsible for the message, she
is not. If any one should be
angry with her on account of
what she said, they would be
very unjust; their quarrel lies
with me, and not with the per-
son whom I employ to act as
mouth for me. He that hath
God's Word, let him speak it
faithfully, and he will have no
need to answer gainsayers, ex-
cept with a "Thus saith the
Lord." This, then, is the mat-
ter concerning which we are
decided.
And now, lastly, WHY

SHOULD WE AT THIS PAR-
TICULAR AGE BE DECIDED

AND BOLD? We should be so

because this age is a doubting

age. It swarms with doubters
as Egypt of old with frogs. You
rub against them everywhere.
Everybody is doubting every-
thing, not merely in religion,
but in politics and social eco-
nomics, in everything indeed. It
is the era of progress, and I
suppose it must be the age,
therefore, unloosening, in order
that the whole body politic may
move on a little further. Well,
brethren, as the age is doubting,
it is wise for us to put our feet
down and stand still where v.; e
are sure we have truth beneath
us. Perhaps, if it were an age
of bigotry, and men would not
learn, we might be more in-
clined to listen to new teachers;
but now the Conservative side
must be ours, or rather the
Radical side, which is the truly
Conservative side. We must go
back to the radix, or root of
truth, and stand sternly by that
which God has revealed, and so
meet the wavering of the age.
Our eloquent neighbor, Mr. Ar-
thur Mursell, has well hit off
the present age:
"Have we gone too far in say-

ing that modern thought has
grown impatient with the Bible,
the gospel, and the cross? Let
us see. What part of the Bible
has it not assailed? The Penta-
teuch it has long ago swept from
the canon as unauthentic. What
we read about the creation and
the flood is branded as fable.
And the laws about the land-
marks, from which Solomon was
not ashamed to quote, are
buried or laid upon the shelf .
"Different men assail differ-

ent portions of the book, and
various systems level their bat-
teries of prejudice at various
points; until by some the Scrip-
ture is torn all to pieces, and
cast to the four winds of heaven,
and by even the most forbear-
ing of the cultured Vandals of
what is called modern thought,
it is condensed into a thin pam-
phlet of morality, instead of the
tome of teaching through which
we have eternal life. There is
hardly a prophet but has been
reviewed by the wiseacres of
the day in precisely the same
spirit as they would review a
work from Mudie's library. The
Temanite and the Shuhite never
misconstrued the bated Job with
half the prejudice of the ac-
knowledged intellects of our
time. Isaiah, instead of being
sawn asunder, is quartered and
hacked to pieces. The weeping
prophet is drowned in his own
tears. Ezekiel is ground to
atoms midst his wheels. Daniel
is de v our ed bodily by the
learned lions. And Jonah is
swallowed by the deep monsters
with a more inexorable voracity
than the fish, for they never
cast him up again. The histories
and events of the great chron-
icle are rudely contradicted and
gainsaid, because some school-
master with a slate and pencil
cannot bring his sums right.
And every miracle which the
might of the Lord wrought for
the favor of his people or the
frustration of their foes, is
pooh - poohed as an absurdity,
because the professors cannot do
the like with their enchant-
ments. A few of what are called
miracles may be credible, be-
cause our leaders think they can
do them themselves. A few na-
tural phenomena, which some
doctor can show to a company
of martinets in a dark room, or
with a table-full of appartus,
will account for the miracle of
the Red Sea. An aeronaut goes
up in a balloon, and then comes
down again, and quite explains
away the pillar of fire and of
cloud, and trifles of that kind.
And so our great men are satis-

fied when they think that their

toy wand has swallowed up the

wand of Aaron; but when

Aaron's wand threatens to swal-
low up theirs, they say that part
is not authentic, and that miracle
never occurred.
"Nor does the New Testament

fare any better than the Old at
the hands of these invaders.
There is no toll of deference
levied on their homage as they
pass across the line. They rec-
ognize no voice of warning with
the cry, 'Take thy shoes from off
thy feet, because the place
whereon thou standest is holy
ground.' The mind which halts
in its carer of spiritual rapine on
any reverential pretext, is de-
nounced as ignorant or slavish.
To hesitate to stamp the hoof
and the vanguard of the thought
of the age has only pity and
sneer for such a feeling, as it
stalks upon its boasted march of
progress. We are told that the
legends of our nurseries are ob-
solete, and that broader views
are gaining ground with
thoughtful minds. We are un-
willing to believe it. The truth
is, that a few, a very few,
thoughtful men, whose thinking
consists in negation from first to
last, and whose minds are tor-
tured with a chronic twist or
curve, which turns them into in-
tellectual notes of interrogation,
have laid the basis of this sys-
tem; these few honest doubters
have been joined by a larger
band who are simply restless;
and these again by men who
are inimical to the spirit and the
truths of Scripture, and together
they have formed a coterie, and
called themselves the leaders of
the thought of the age. They
have a following, it is true; but
of whom does it consist? Of the
mere satellites of fashion. Of
the wealth, the pedantry, and
the stupidity of our large popu-
lations. A string of carriages is
seen 'setting down' and 'taking
up' at the door where an ad-
vanced professor is to lecture,
and because the milliner is ad-
vertised from floor to ceiling in
the lecture room, these views
are said to be gaining ground.
But in an age of fashion like
this, who ever suspects these
minions of the mode of having
any views at all? It becames
respectable to follow a certain
name for a time, and so the
vainlings go to follow the name
and the display the dress. But
as to views, one would no more
suspect such people of having
any views than they would
dream of charging more than a
tenth part of the crowds who go
to the Royal Academy's exhibi-
tion with understanding the
laws of perspective. It is the
thing to do: and so every one
who has a dress to show and a
lounge to air, goes to show it,
and all who would in the fash-
ion (and who would not?) are
bound to advance with the
times. And hence we find the
times advancing over the sacred
precincts of the New Testament,
as though it were the floor of
Saint Alban's or of a professor's
lecture room; and ladies drag
their trains, and dandies set
their dress-boots on the authen-
ticity of this, or the authority
of that, or the inspiration of the
other. People who never heard
of Strauss, or Bauer, or of Tu-
bingen, are quite prepared to
say that our Saviour was but a
well-meaning man, who had
great many faults, and made a
great many mistakes; that his
miracles, as recorded in the
New Testament were in part
imaginary, iind in part account-
able by natural theories; that
,the raising of Lazarus never oc-
curred, since the Gospel of John
is a forgery from first to last;
that the atonement is a doctrine
to be scouted as bloody and un-
righteous; that Paul was a fa-
natic who wrote unthinkingly;
and that much of what bears his
name was never written by him
at all. Thus is the Bible rubbed
through the tribulum of criti-

cism from Genesis to Revel

tion, until, in the faith of tfOr
age in which we live, as 1.0 1 "

resented by its so-called leade. u
there are but a few inspin it
fragments here and there 1
maining." ye
We must be decided. WI'

have Dissenters been doing.
a great exent lately but try
to be fine? How many of O't
ministers are laboring to ,er•
grand orators or intellecti1e n.
thinkers? That is not the thiltu,r.n
Our young ministers have b uni
dazzled by that, and have g /
off to bray like wild asses un elf,
the notion that they would tDSe,
be reputed to have come fi. XL.
Jerusalem, or to have bad
reared in Germany. The woklinl
has found them out. There Ilg
nothing now I believe that g,'.s I
uine Christians despise !Ike.
than the foolish affectation e I
intellectualism. You will hefted
good old deacon say, "Mr. Jess.
,and-so, whom we had here, 1We]
a very clever man, and preackaoe

wonderful sermons, but it tu,
cause had gone down through!very
We can hardly pay the null tarn
ter, and we mean next time ton
have one of the old-fashiolte N,
ministers back again who lturrie
lieve in something and preltIlloi;
it. There will be no addition' and
our church else." Will yoti ear
out and tell the people that r11 Inc
believe you can say somtbie d
but you hardly know what; r(Con
are not quite sure that
you preach is correct, but
trust-deed requires you to 1 y
it, and therefore you say
Why, you may cause fools
idiots to be pleased with
and you will be sure to pr, v
gate infidelity, but you can ta
more. When a prophet corPOTE

forward he must speak as Mill
the Lord, and if he cannot. s
that, let him go back to his ‘ed
It is quite certain, dear foe a E

that nor or never we most ts f131
decided, because the age je 4111
manifestly drifting. You call
watch for twelve months 000/
out seeing how it is going el, ,Ibe
the tide; the anchors are Ptià•,:ctto
du eps, t ar un cdt itohne. vIet s sies l disrifftlionagtirtoo ,

as near as I can tell you, 0,1;
east, and is nearing Cape V' D

can, and if it drives much.C°. OYil
ther in that direction, it W1 sb,
on the rocks of the Roman "C
We must get aboard her, roisar.
connect her with the glorlects1'
steam-tug of gospel truth, Airie
drag her back. I should be,karjc,
if I could take her round Le 'ishe
Cape Calvin, right up into Jo th

of Calvary, and anchor ile:AblerE
the fair haven which is  fin,
over by Vera Cruz, or the otey -
God grant us grace to do It
must have a strong hand,
have our steam up, and,
the current; and so by I•N
grace we shall both save Alt ee
age and the generations f ir P:

se
dee
'in.
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of course he does not bn eou
that Jesus was divine. Th,", Dra
who made the film was l‘m.• ' so
B. DeMille, and his yacht list oi•
raided in New York harbor° did
other day and a lot of Kit; the
liquor was seized." Then I „Pion
"Mr. B— we just don'tt
that the Savior's life shottLftirh
handled with such unholy  hi
as the hands of these me° t`7.1 A
described." 

. .....av
: th(We still feel the same -

about it!
• 4To have the Savior's liter 

t1 a.
ed under the direction of 111: 1111]

' that kind, then the parts 171' the

by Hollywood actors (and 1131est
lywood is notorious), theniklett
it presented in a movie ' `Ult
where the Lord's Day is °lye he
crated by Sunday movie"ti!cl,
all sorts of dirt is shosy r
well, we just can't see c acc

' sort of thing as right! °rill

`M.\.
come.


